
BASE BID

Cold Applied Shipping Estimate
Contractor Bid Amount Materials Total Included in Mat'ls
Schreiber Roofing $1,132,000.00 $1,136,421.84 $2,268,421.84 $5,000.00 * Cannot meet completion date

Schena Roofing $1,536,900.00 $1,208,828.75 $2,745,728.75 $5,000.00 * October Start - cannot meet completion date
LaDuke Roofing $976,420.00 $1,181,677.36 $2,158,097.36 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 78 working days
Molnar Roofing $10,050.00 $10,050.00 $5,000.00
Royal Roofing $1,370,900.00 $1,322,469.90 $2,693,369.90 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 7 work weeks

Lutz Roofing $1,193,000.00 $1,235,919.55 $2,428,919.55 $5,000.00 * Early/Mid October - 55 working days

ALTERNATE #1 BID
Heat Applied Shipping Estimate

Contractor Bid Amount Materials Total Included in Mat'ls
Schreiber Roofing $1,141,000.00 $1,063,448.94 $2,204,448.94 $5,000.00 * Cannot meet completion date

Schena Roofing NO BID $10,050.00 NO BID $5,000.00 * October Start - cannot meet completion date
LaDuke Roofing $973,600.00 $1,103,808.91 $2,077,408.91 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 78 working days
Molnar Roofing $10,050.00 $10,050.00 $5,000.00
Royal Roofing $1,399,900.00 $1,189,756.44 $2,589,656.44 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 7 work weeks

Lutz Roofing $1,263,000.00 $1,147,769.95 $2,410,769.95 $5,000.00 * Early/Mid October - 55 working days

ALTERNATE #2 BID
Hot Kettle Shipping Estimate

Contractor Bid Amount Materials Total Included in Mat'ls
Schreiber Roofing $1,110,000.00 $996,534.84 $2,106,534.84 $5,000.00 * Cannot meet completion date

Schena Roofing NO BID $10,050.00 NO BID $5,000.00 * October Start - cannot meet completion date
LaDuke Roofing $969,600.00 $1,027,974.91 $1,997,574.91 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 78 working days
Molnar Roofing $10,050.00 $10,050.00 $5,000.00
Royal Roofing $1,387,900.00 $1,230,939.45 $2,618,839.45 $5,000.00 * September 1 start date - 7 work weeks

Lutz Roofing $1,210,000.00 $1,107,536.35 $2,317,536.35 $5,000.00 * Early/Mid October - 55 working days

Detroit Public Library

Library Roof Replacement
Bid Result Tabulation

Shipping Estimates are included in the Materials Price as identified above.
Due to fluctuations in the shipping industry, quotes can only be held for 7 days

and are therefore subject to minor fluctations at the time of the purchase order/delivery


